BUYER: Rob Taylor 6581 OF OPENING DATE: October 29th, 2021
State Purchasing Bureau
FILE FOLDER NAME FOR REFERENCE PURPOSES ------------=-==--cumeu-- > Bid 1 Bid 2 Bid 3 Bid 4 Bid 5
COMMODITY NAME Volvo Trucks of[ RDO Truck Truck Center Cornhusker Truck Center
Omaha Centers Companies International Companies
LINE # DESCRIPTION QTY |UOM UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1|60000 GVWR TANDEM AXIL CHASSIS W/14' RDS DUMP BODY & TOP Pl 10| EA | S 240,910.00 | $ 400,263.00 | S 224,754.00 [ $ 397,017.00 | $ 238,371.00
2|DEDUCT FULLER 10 SPEED - TRANSMISSION 14908LL 10| EA | S (7,000.00)| S (11,603.00)( $ (6,910.00)| S (6,150.00)| S (6,910.00)
3|[DEDUCT FULLER 13 SPEED - TRANSMISSION 14913A 10| EA | S (6,800.00)| S (10,851.00)( $ (5,839.00)| S (4,200.00)| S (5,839.00)
4|DEDUCT EATON FULLER ULTRASHIFT - 10 SPEED TRANSMISSION 10 EA [$  (6,200.00)] S (12,295.00)| $  (1,579.00)| $  (3,100.00)| $  (1,579.00)
5[DEDUCT EATON FULLER ULTRASHIFT - 13 SPEED TRANSMISSION 10| EA | S (4,200.00)| S (9,426.00)| S (2,618.00)| S (5,500.00)| S (2,618.00)
6|DEDUCT EATON FULLER ULTRASHIFT - 18 SPEED TRANSMISSION 10[ EA [ (350.00)| $  (8,991.00)| $  (1,987.00)[ $  (3,300.00)[ §  (1,987.00)
7|V-PLOW WITH QUICK ATTACH HITCH 10| EA |S 21,899.00 S 21,899.00|S 21,899.00 S 21,899.00|S$  21,899.00
8[V-PLOW QUICK HITCH WITHOUT V-PLOW 10| EA | S 2,883.00 | $ 2,883.00 [ $ 2,883.00 | $ 2,883.00 | $ 2,883.00
9|RIGHT HAND BENCHING WING 10| EA |S 12,503.00($ 12,503.00|S$ 12,503.00 [ $ 11,536.00|S$ 12,503.00
10|PRE WET SYSTEM 10| EA | S 18,517.00|$ 18,5517.00|S 18,517.00|S$ 17,550.00|S$ 18,517.00
11|RIGHT HAND HIGH BENCHING WING 10| EA | S 18,517.00|$ 18,5517.00|S 18,517.00$ 17,550.00 |$ 18,517.00
12|RIGHT HAND SEVED DUTY HIGH BENCHING WING 10| EA |S 19,261.00 S 19,261.00|S 19,261.00 (S 18,637.00|S$  19,261.00
13|PRE WET SYSTEM 10| EA | S 4,997.00 | $ 4,997.00 | $ 4,997.00 | $ 4,997.00 | $ 4,997.00
14|RIGHT HAND MID MOUNT WING 10| EA |S 9,013.00 | $ 9,013.00 | S 9,013.00 | $ 9,013.00 | $ 9,013.00
15|LEFT HAND MID MOUNT WING 10| EA | S 9,240.00 | $ 9,240.00 | S 9,240.00 | S 9,240.00 | $ 9,240.00
16(3 JOYSTICK CONTROL IN LIEU OF SINGLE JOYSTICK CONTROL 10| EA |S 1,055.00 | $ 1,055.00 | $ 1,055.00 | $ 1,055.00 | $ 1,055.00
17|ADD TOW PLOW 10| EA | S 155,386.00 | S 152,286.00 | S 152,286.00 [ $ 152,286.00 | $ 152,286.00
18|CHASSIS ONLY NO RDS BODY OR TOW PLOW 5| EA | S 129,950.00 [ $ 134,017.00|S$ 111,794.00 | S 131,500.00 [ $ 125,364.00
19|CHASSIS HYDRAULICS TO RUN TOW PLOW 5| EA NO BID NO BID NO BID S 45,000.00 NO BID
20(ADD BI-DIRECTIONAL TOW PLOW 5| EA | S 194,613.00 [ S 194,613.00 | S 193,448.00 | S 193,844.00 [ $ 193,448.00
21|PLOW BALANCE VALVE 15| EA | S 639.00 | S 639.00 | S 639.00 | S 639.00 | S 639.00
22| TRANSMISSION REPAIR MANUAL FOR MANUAL TRANSMISSION 15| EA | S 500.00 | $ - S 75.00 | $ - S 75.00
23| TRANSMISSION REPAIR MANUAL FOR AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION 15| EA | S 600.00 | S 95.00 [ $ 165.00 | $ 300.00 | S 165.00
24|P.C. SOFTWARE WITH DATA LINK CONNECTION 15| EA | S 3,900.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 1,750.00 | $ - S 1,750.00
25|SINGLE AXLE CAB 15| EA | S  12,500.00 NO BID S  83,991.00 NO BID S 91,963.00
26|CHASSIS ONLY 15| EA | S 129,500.00 NO BID S 237,574.00 NO BID S 224,754.00
PAYMENT TERMS: 15 DAYS N/A 30 DAYS 10 DAYS 30 DAYS
DELIVERY DAYS ARO: 200+ TBD TBD TBD TBD
COMMENTS: FREIGHTLINER
SD114 & WESTERN STAR
AL;EEENSTE MONROE NO BID ON |47X & MONROE
LINE 19 ON BID TRANSMISSION TRUCK LINES 25 & 26 TRUCK
SAYS INCLUDED BID, LINE 18 EQUIPMENT, DUETO EQUIPMENT -
WITH LINE 1 COST INCLUDED INC - LINE 26 IS [ NEEDING MORE| LINE 26 IS WITH
IN LINE 1 COST WITH SPECS COMPLETE
COMPLETE BODY
BODY
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